
PAGE 1
BID NUMBER:  37-15
DATE OPENED:  JANUARY 13, 2015

BID TABULATION FOR ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT FOR PHARMACEUTICALS

ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT

NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

GROUP 1

1 8.4% sodium bicarbonate 190 each 6.7900 $1,290.10 10.500 $1,995.00 16.980 $3,226.20 7.000 $1,330.00

2 0.9% sodium chloride, IV bag, 1000 ml 3,000 each 1.4500 $4,350.00 No Bid 9.990 $29,970.00 No Bid

3 0.9% sodium chloride, IV bag, 500 ml 2,240 each 1.3800 $3,091.20 No Bid 9.990 $22,377.60 No Bid

4 0.9% sodium chloride, IV bag, 250 ml 100 each 1.3800 $138.00 No Bid 8.790 $879.00 No Bid

5 0.9% sodium chloride, flush syringe 1,600 each 0.3500 $560.00 No Bid 29.990 $47,984.00 No Bid

6 aspirin 120 bottle 0.6600 $79.20 2.990 $358.80 0.990 $118.80 No Bid

7 adenosine, 12mg 100 each 9.9500 $995.00 113.170 $11,317.00 6.650 $665.00 No Bid

8 albuterol sulfate 650 each 0.1368 $88.92 0.250 $162.50 0.250 $162.50 No Bid

9 amiodarone hydrochloride 370 each 1.7900 $662.30 3.990 $1,476.30 4.250 $1,572.50 No Bid

10 atropine sulfate 370 each 4.3500 $1,609.50 No Bid 9.250 $3,422.50 4.200 $1,554.00

11 calcium chloride 170 each 5.1500 $875.50 13.260 $2,254.20 10.880 $1,849.60 4.930 $838.10

12 dextrose, 25% 100 each 8.6500 $865.00 No Bid 16.360 $1,636.00 No Bid

13 dextrose, 50% 515 each 6.4500 $3,321.75 No Bid 23.650 $12,179.75 6.380 $3,285.70

14 diphenhydramine 300 each 0.9500 $285.00 0.760 $228.00 1.150 $345.00 No Bid

15 epinephrine, 1:1,000 ampule     (Frisco) 120 each 1.7900 $214.80 2.880 $345.60 2.620 $314.40 No Bid

16 epinephrine, 1:1,000 vial 150 each 7.9500 $1,192.50 11.080 $1,662.00 16.990 $2,548.50 7.560 $1,134.00

17 epinephrine, 1:10,000 vial 650 each 6.1500 $3,997.50 10.040 $6,526.00 12.500 $8,125.00 6.160 $4,004.00

18 etomidate 50 each 38.2500 $1,912.50 49.680 $2,484.00 16.720 $836.00 No Bid

19 glucagon kit 200 each 235.0000 $47,000.00 207.140 $41,428.00 325.550 $65,110.00 No Bid

20 Insta-Glucose     (Frisco) 100 each 3.6500 $365.00 6.500 $650.00 6.250 $625.00 No Bid

21 glucose gel 220 each 0.9133 $200.93 5.860 $1,289.20 5.450 $1,199.00 No Bid

22 ipratropium bromide 650 each 0.1196 $77.74 3.080 $2,002.00 0.200 $130.00 No Bid

23 lidocaine 2% 300 each 3.9500 $1,185.00 5.750 $1,725.00 No Bid 3.920 $1,176.00

24 lidocaine jelly 200 each 4.3500 $870.00 4.640 $928.00 11.690 $2,338.00 40.430 $8,086.00

25 magnesium sulfate 120 each 1.6800 $201.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 methylprednisolone sodium succinate 50 each 6.5800 $329.00 108.540 $5,427.00 No Bid No Bid

27 Energix-B     (Frisco) 40 each 64.3500 $2,574.00 60.180 $2,407.20 No Bid No Bid

UNIT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT

Bound Tree Medical Diamond Drugs Inc. Global Medical Services Taylor Distributions Group
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Bound Tree Medical Diamond Drugs Inc. Global Medical Services Taylor Distributions Group

28 naloxone hydrachloride 320 each 36.9500 $11,824.00 No Bid No Bid 35.280 $11,289.60

29 Diltiazem     (Frisco) 70 each 10.7500 $752.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 NaCl iv bag 70 each 1.4900 $104.30 4.600 $322.00 No Bid No Bid

31 enalaprilat 70 each 3.4500 $241.50 5.290 $370.30 No Bid No Bid

32 nitroglycerin spray 145 each 148.0000 $21,460.00 139.990 $20,298.55 289.000 $41,905.00 No Bid

33 nitroglycerin tablet 40 each 14.9500 $598.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

34 norepinephrine bitartrate 50 each 3.9200 $196.00 3.100 $155.00 No Bid No Bid

35 ondansetron, injection 325 each 0.4700 $152.75 1.030 $334.75 No Bid No Bid

36 ondansetron, tablet 155 each 9.2000 $1,426.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

41 cyanokit 20 each 795.2500 $15,905.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 adenosine, 6mg    (Frisco) 150 each 4.5000 $675.00 25.780 $3,867.00 No Bid No Bid

Sub-total for Group I $131,667.09 $110,013.40 $249,519.35 $32,697.40

GROUP II

37 fentanyl citrate 300 each 1.0340 $310.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

38 midazolam 225 each 1.5450 $347.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 morphine sulfate 300 each 2.4950 $748.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

40 ketamine hydrochloride 110 each 8.7250 $959.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sub-total for Group II $2,366.08 -                  -                  -                  

submitted paperwork yes yes no no

stated brands yes yes yes yes

piggy-back yes yes not stated not stated

internet yes "yes" yes yes

delivery time 2 - 3 days 5 - 7 days 4 days 1 - 3 days

minimum order none $50.00 $150.00 none

discount 22.5% cost + 15% 0.5% 10.0%

TOTAL GROSS PRICE $134,033.16 $110,013.40 $249,519.35 32,697.40        
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