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BID NUMBER: 37-16
DATE OPENED: February 25, 2016

BID TABULATION
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT FOR

IRRIGATION SUPPLIES

ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. UNIT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT

NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 1/2" Male adapter, pvc 100 ea 0.1430 $14.30 0.160 $16.00 0.1500 $15.00

2 1/2" Female adapter, PVC 100 ea 0.1780 $17.80 0.200 $20.00 0.1900 $19.00

3 1/2" x 1/2" Coupling, SXS, PVC 100 ea 0.0980 $9.80 0.110 $11.00 0.1100 $11.00

4 1/2" x 1/2" Coupling, TXT, PVC 125 ea 0.4930 $61.63 0.250 $31.25 0.2100 $26.25

5 1/2" x 1/2" x 1/2" Tee, SXSXT, PVC 50 ea 0.2490 $12.45 0.290 $14.50 0.2700 $13.50

6 1/2" x 1/2" x 1/2" Tee, SXS, PVC 60 ea 0.1880 $11.28 0.220 $13.20 0.2100 $12.60

7 1/2" x 1/2" Ell, TXT, PVC 50 ea 0.4020 $20.10 0.420 $21.00 0.4000 $20.00

8 1/2" x 1/2" Ell, SXT, PVC 125 ea 0.1780 $22.25 0.220 $27.50 0.2100 $26.25

9 1/2" x 6" Cut-off nipple, plastic 200 ea 0.1450 $29.00 0.240 $48.00 0.2600 $52.00

10 1/2" x 8" SCH 80 PVC nipple 50 ea 0.3580 $17.90 0.470 $23.50 0.4900 $24.50

11 1/2" x 12" SCH 80 PVC nipple 50 ea 0.4220 $21.10 0.650 $32.50 0.6700 $33.50

12 1/2" x 12" SCH 80 PVC nipple 50 ea 0.4220 $21.10 0.650 $32.50 0.6700 $33.50

13 3/4" Female adapter, PVC 50 ea 0.2280 $11.40 0.250 $12.50 0.2400 $12.00

14 3/4" x 1/2" Bushing, SXS, PVC 125 ea 0.1580 $19.75 0.180 $22.50 0.1700 $21.25

15 3/4" x 1/2" Bushing, TXT, PVC 20 ea 0.4650 $9.30 0.520 $10.40 0.4900 $9.80

16 3/4" x 1/2" Ell, SXT, PVC 125 ea 0.2230 $27.88 0.260 $32.50 0.2500 $31.25

17 3/4" x 3/4" Coupling, TXT, PVC 200 ea 0.3920 $78.40 0.410 $82.00 0.3900 $78.00

18 3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" Tee, SXSXT, PVC 50 ea 0.4270 $21.35 0.450 $22.50 0.4300 $21.50

19 3/4" x 3/4" Ell, SXT, PVC 50 ea 0.2280 $11.40 0.250 $12.50 0.2400 $12.00

20 3/4" x 3" SCH 80 PVC nipple 50 ea 0.2960 $14.80 0.290 $14.50 0.3000 $15.00

21 1" Male adapter, PVC 150 ea 0.2720 $40.80 0.320 $48.00 0.3000 $45.00

22 1" Female adapter, PVC 25 ea 0.2690 $6.73 0.290 $7.25 0.2700 $6.75

23 1" x 1" Coupling, TXT, PVC 50 ea 0.5140 $25.70 0.540 $27.00 0.2600 $13.00

24 1" x 2" SCH 80 PVC nipple 200 ea 0.3220 $64.40 0.380 $76.00 0.3800 $76.00

25 1" x 3" SCH 80 PVC nipple 400 ea 0.4080 $163.20 0.440 $176.00 0.4400 $176.00

26 1" x 4" SCH 80 PVC nipple 300 ea 0.5280 $158.40 0.520 $156.00 0.5200 $156.00

27 1" x 6" SCH 80 PVC nipple 75 ea 0.7100 $53.25 0.710 $53.25 0.7100 $53.25
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28 1" x 1" x 1/2" Tee, SXSXT, PVC 200 ea 0.5000 $100.00 0.590 $118.00 0.5500 $110.00

29 1" x 1" Ell, TXT, PVC 200 ea 1.3450 $269.00 1.340 $268.00 0.4400 $88.00

30 1" x 1" Ell, SXS, PVC 400 ea 0.2870 $114.80 0.350 $140.00 0.3300 $132.00

31 1-1/4 "x 1" Bushing, SXS, PVC 125 ea 0.4060 $50.75 0.450 $56.25 0.4300 $53.75

32 1-1/4" Ell, SXS, PVC 75 ea 0.5350 $40.13 0.630 $47.25 0.5900 $44.25

33 1-1/4" Ell, SXT, PVC 10 ea 0.9020 $9.02 0.790 $7.90 0.7000 $7.00

34 1-1/2" Male adapter, PVC 125 ea 0.4650 $58.13 0.520 $65.00 0.4900 $61.25

35 1-1/2" Female adapter, PVC 25 ea 0.5150 $12.88 0.520 $13.00 0.4900 $12.25

36 1-1/2" x 1-1/2" Tee, SXSXS, PVC 100 ea 0.8050 $80.50 0.890 $89.00 0.8400 $84.00

37 1-1/2" x 1 -1/2" Ell, SXS, PVC 100 ea 0.5770 $57.70 0.670 $67.00 0.6300 $63.00

38 1-1/2" x 1 -1/2" Ell, SXT, PVC 20 ea 0.9320 $18.64 0.870 $17.40 0.7800 $15.60

39 1-1/2" x 6" SCH 80 PVC nipple 125 ea 1.2400 $155.00 1.060 $132.50 1.0700 $133.75

40 1/2" Slip fixes, PVC 100 ea 1.7000 $170.00 1.110 $111.00 1.7200 $172.00

41 3/4" Slip fixes, PVC 100 ea 1.7500 $175.00 1.220 $122.00 1.8100 $181.00

42 1" Slip fixes, PVC 100 ea 2.0000 $200.00 1.400 $140.00 2.1900 $219.00

43 1-1/2" Slip fixes, PVC 100 ea 4.3000 $430.00 2.920 $292.00 4.9400 $494.00

44 2" Slip fixes, PVC 25 ea 6.5750 $164.38 4.450 $111.25 6.8900 $172.25

45 2-1/2" Slip fixes, PVC 25 ea 10.6500 $266.25 6.920 $173.00 9.8800 $247.00

46 3" Slip fixes, PVC 25 ea 13.3250 $333.13 8.650 $216.25 13.3600 $334.00

47 4" Slip fixes, PVC 25 ea 23.2750 $581.88 15.120 $378.00 23.4900 $587.25

48 1/2" Compression couplings, PVC 10 ea 1.7750 $17.75 1.480 $14.80 1.6900 $16.90

49 3/4" Compression couplings, PVC 10 ea 2.4000 $24.00 1.940 $19.40 2.2100 $22.10

50 1" Compression couplings, PVC 20 ea 3.1200 $62.40 2.530 $50.60 2.8700 $57.40

51 1-1/2" Compression couplings, PVC 10 ea 4.9350 $49.35 3.950 $39.50 4.5400 $45.40

52 2" Compression couplings, PVC 10 ea 6.4200 $64.20 5.610 $56.10 5.9000 $59.00

53 PEB electric remote control valve, 1" Rain Bird or city appr. equal 20 ea 49.6550 $993.10 48.820 $976.40 51.4500 $1,029.00

54 PEB electric remote control valve, 1-1/2" Rain Bird or city appr. equal 30 ea 66.2070 $1,986.21 65.100 $1,953.00 68.6000 $2,058.00
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55 PEB electric remote control valve ,2" Rain Bird or city approved equal 20 ea 87.4790 $1,749.58 86.020 $1,720.40 91.4700 $1,829.40

56 V80040 solenoid w adptr Rain Bird UNIK cntroler,or cae 150 ea 19.8580 $2,978.70 21.440 $3,216.00 20.5800 $3,087.00

57 Hunter head #140, or city approved equal. 50 ea 44.6250 $2,231.25 1.080 $54.00 46.1600 $2,308.00

58 Hunter sm stream rotor,  PGPADJ-04-A, complt head assm 100 ea 6.9800 $698.00 7.500 $750.00 7.1900 $719.00

59 Hunter I-20-ADS, or city approved equal. 200 ea 13.6680 $2,733.60 14.960 $2,992.00 14.6000 $2,920.00

60 Hunter 1-25-HS-SS 50 ea 70.1250 $3,506.25 72.600 $3,630.00 70.8600 $3,543.00

61 Hunter I-20-360, or city approved equal. 100 ea 9.9750 $997.50 11.000 $1,100.00 12.0200 $1,202.00

62 Hunter 1-25-ADS-SS 50 ea 29.7500 $1,487.50 30.800 $1,540.00 30.0600 $1,503.00

63 Controller, Rain Bird UNIK, 1-Station, or city approved equal. 150 ea 101.6810 $15,252.15 105.860 $15,879.00 105.3500 $15,802.50

64 Controller, Rain Bird UNIK, 2-Station, or city approved equal. 150 ea 118.2110 $17,731.65 123.090 $18,463.50 122.5000 $18,375.00

65 Controller, Rain Bird UNIK, 4-Station, or city approved equal. 150 ea 137.1340 $20,570.10 142.780 $21,417.00 142.1000 $21,315.00

66 RD600-EXT, 6", outdoor, Raindial, or city approved equal. 5 ea 96.5240 $482.62 101.480 $507.40 100.3000 $501.50

67 RD900-EXT, 9", outdoor, Raindial, or city approved equal. 5 ea 134.1520 $670.76 141.040 $705.20 139.4000 $697.00

68 RD1200-EXT, 12", outdoor, Raindial, or city approved equal. 5 ea 176.6880 $883.44 185.760 $928.80 183.6000 $918.00

69 IBOC Controller-4 plus, or city approved equal. 5 ea 548.0600 $2,740.30 610.090 $3,050.45 569.5000 $2,847.50

70 IBOC Controller-8 plus, or city approved equal. 5 ea 666.6700 $3,333.35 742.130 $3,710.65 692.7500 $3,463.75

71 IBOC Controller-12 plus, or city approved equal. 5 ea 740.2900 $3,701.45 824.080 $4,120.40 769.2500 $3,846.25

72 Irritrol, E2003 DC latching solenoid, or city approved equal. 50 ea 16.3600 $818.00 16.390 $819.50 15.8300 $791.50

73 Lasco 1" slip compact ball valve 30 ea 3.9500 $118.50 1.970 $59.10 2.7500 $82.50

74 Lasco 2" slip compact ball valve 10 ea 10.9810 $109.81 6.830 $68.30 7.6200 $76.20

75 3" Brass double check valve Febco #805 or city approved equal. 5 ea 1497.3170 $7,486.59 1248.780 $6,243.90 1536.9700 $7,684.85

76 4" Brass double check valve Febco #805 or city approved equal. 5 ea 1545.2000 $7,726.00 1629.270 $8,146.35 1586.2900 $7,931.45

77 Lasco 1-1/2" slip compact ball valve 5 ea 8.4930 $42.47 4.960 $24.80 5.4100 $27.05

78 Valve box, 10" round w/lid, DFW Plastics or City approved equal 100 ea 7.0560 $705.60 5.640 $564.00 6.1300 $613.00

79 Valve box, 6" round w/lid, DFW Plastics or City approved equal 30 ea 1.9580 $58.74 1.860 $55.80 2.1400 $64.20

80 Valve box 15" x 20" Jumbo w/lid, DFW Plastics or City approved equal 50 ea 30.2800 $1,514.00 25.960 $1,298.00 26.5600 $1,328.00

81 Valve box 12" x 17" standard w/lid, DFW Plastics or City approved equal 150 ea 15.4920 $2,323.80 12.200 $1,830.00 13.1600 $1,974.00
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82 #300-13 Nozzle, Toro only 1 ea 2.2400 $2.24 2.510 $2.51 2.3700 $2.37

83 Rain Bird bubbler Nozzle, .5 GPM 100 ea 2.2400 $224.00 2.320 $232.00 2.3200 $232.00

84 Rain Bird bubbler Nozzle, .75 GPM 50 ea 2.2400 $112.00 2.320 $116.00 2.3200 $116.00

85 Rain Bird bubbler Nozzle, 1.0 GPM 100 ea 2.2400 $224.00 2.320 $232.00 2.3200 $232.00

86 #570-6P Sprinkler, 6", Toro only 300 ea 4.7150 $1,414.50 4.820 $1,446.00 4.9900 $1,497.00

87 #570C-4P Sprinkler, 4", Toro only 150 ea 1.1040 $165.60 1.130 $169.50 1.4100 $211.50

88 #570-Nozzels, various, Toro only. 800 ea 1.0580 $846.40 1.120 $896.00 1.1200 $896.00

89 #570-C-12P, Popup, 12", Toro only 150 ea 7.8430 $1,176.45 7.390 $1,108.50 7.6500 $1,147.50

90 FSH-LG Nozzle, Toro only 200 ea 1.0580 $211.60 1.070 $214.00 1.1200 $224.00

91 FSQ-LG Nozzle, Toro only 1 ea 1.0600 $1.06 1.070 $1.07 1.1200 $1.12

92 #200-01-04 Valve, Toro only 40 ea No Bid No Bid 18.8900 $755.60

93 #200-01-06 Valve, Toro only 1 ea No Bid No Bid 60.4000 $60.40

94 #252-01-08 Valve, Toro only 5 ea No Bid 111.260 $556.30 75.9700 $379.85

95 #252-06-08 Valve, Toro only 1 ea No Bid 80.730 $80.73 75.9700 $75.97

96 #640-20 Body package, Toro only 40 ea 16.100 $644.00 17.050 $682.00 17.0400 $681.60

97 Hunter rain sensors, rain click, wireless 5 ea 46.695 $233.48 55.000 $275.00 53.6800 $268.40

98 Hunter rain sensors, rain click, hard wire 10 ea 15.264 $152.64 29.480 $294.80 16.5200 $165.20

99 Rain Bird Poly/funny pipe SPX100 15 ea 17.446 $261.69 16.250 $243.75 17.1600 $257.40

100 Lasco Insert Ell #3000-005 1/2" 1000 ea 0.180 $180.00 0.150 $150.00 0.1100 $110.00

101 01-101 - Hand Pump LP Plastic valve box pump 6ft 15 ea 31.470 $472.05 25.330 $379.95 22.3500 $335.25

102 Direct Bury 14 gauge zone wire 2500' 10 ea 169.050 $1,690.50 180.590 $1,805.90 198.1200 $1,981.20

103 Class 200 PVC pipe, 1/2" 1000 ft 0.103 $103.40 0.090 $90.00 0.1000 $100.00

104 Class 200 PVC pipe, 3/4" 3000 ft 0.120 $359.10 0.110 $330.00 0.1100 $330.00

105 Class 200 PVC pipe, 1" 8000 ft 0.153 $1,224.80 0.140 $1,120.00 0.1500 $1,200.00

106 Class 200 PVC pipe, 1.5" 1000 ft 0.335 $335.20 0.310 $310.00 0.3100 $310.00

107 Class 200 PVC pipe, 2" 1000 ft 0.494 $494.20 0.490 $490.00 0.5000 $500.00

108 DIG Excel series 17mm press. compnsating drip line 12" spacing 100' rolls 10 ea 23.800 $238.00 20.890 $208.90 21.6500 $216.50
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109 DIG air vacuum relief valve 1/2" MNPT 10 ea 5.368 $53.68 3.890 $38.90 4.4100 $44.10

110 DIG 1/2" barbed fittings 17mm insert coupling 50 ea 0.242 $12.10 0.180 $9.00 0.1400 $7.00

111 DIG 1/2" barbed fittings 17mm insert elbow coupling 50 ea 0.337 $16.85 0.230 $11.50 0.1800 $9.00

112 DIG 1/2" barbed fittings 17mm 1/2" male adapter tee 50 ea No Bid 0.290 $14.50 0.2600 $13.00

113 DIG 1/2" barbed fittings 17mm 1/2" male adapter 50 ea 0.413 $20.65 0.290 $14.50 0.2000 $10.00

114 DIG 1/2" barbed fittings 17mm 1/2" elbow MNPT adapter 50 ea No Bid 0.280 $14.00 0.4800 $24.00

115 DIG 3/4" female adapter TEE barbed fittings 17mm 1/2" 50 ea 0.926 $46.30 0.960 $48.00 0.6500 $32.50

116 Delivery Available 1 Y/N Yes Yes Yes

117 Delivery Charge 1 ea 0.000 $0.00 0.000 $0.00 0.0000 $0.00

118 Delivery Time 1 day 1 day 1 day 1 day

119 Discount from List Price for Parts Not Listed 1 pct 0% 45% 50%

TOTAL GROSS PRICE $121,017.81 $121,198.31 $125,390.16

CASH DISCOUNT

TOTAL NET PRICE

DELIVERY As needed As needed As needed

F.O.B Destination Destination Destination


