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BID NUMBER: 67-16

DATE OPENED: August 1, 2016

BID TABULATION - BEST VALUE
A/R/C SCREEN-PRINTED AND EMBROIDERED ITEMS

Groggy Dog Sportswear Logotology Utopia Graphix Impress Designs, Inc.
ITEM BST. UNIT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT
DESCRIPTION
NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 | T-shirt, SS, 100% cotton, white 1 job 5,240.00 $5,240.00 5,733.00 $5,733.00 4,967.00 $4,967.00
2 | T-shirt, SS, 100% cotton, dark 1 job 2,490.00 $2,490.00 3,239.50 $3,239.50 2,667.50 $2,667.50 **NON-RESPONSIVE**
3 | T-shirt, SS, 100% cotton, light 1 job 2,860.00 $2,860.00 2,710.40 $2,710.40 2,693.75 $2,693.75
4 | T-shirt, SS, 50/50 blend, light 1 job 3,320.00 $3,320.00 2,301.00 2,301.00 3,311.00 $3,311.00
5 | T-shirt, SS, 50/50 blend, dark 1 job 1,090.00 $1,090.00 1,529.88 $1,529.88 1,141.37 $1,141.37
6 | T-shirt, LS, 100% cotton, white 1 job 1,330.00 $1,330.00 1,443.15 $1,443.15 1,320.80 $1,320.80
7 | T-shirt, LS, 100% cotton, dark 1 job 1,030.00 $1,030.00 1,649.70 $1,649.70 1,067.19 $1,067.19
8 | T-shirt, SS, 100% cotton, white, 4-color 1 job 5,450.00 $5,450.00 4,056.00 $4,056.00 4,691.00 $4,691.00
9 | T-shirt, SS, 100% cotton, black, 4-color 1 job 5,720.00 $5,720.00 NO BID 5,755.00 $5,755.00
10 | Polo shirt, light, embroidered 1 job 915.00 $915.00 865.41 $865.41 803.36 803.36
11 | Polo shirt, dark, embroidered 1 job 500.00 $500.00 408.96 $408.96 524.82 524.82
12 | Lightweight denim, LS, embroidered 1 job 960.00 $960.00 902.68 $902.68 839.65 839.65
13 | Heavyweight denim, LS, embroidered 1 job 960.00 $960.00 928.44 $928.44 840.89 840.89
14 | cap, unstructured, embroidered 1 job 250.00 $250.00 614.25 $614.25 202.19 202.19
15 | cap, unstructured, screen printed 1 job NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 | cap, structured, embroidered 1 job 230.00 $230.00 362.00 $362.00 186.50 186.50
17 | Ladies Tank top, 100% cotton 1 job 330.00 $330.00 358.05 $358.05 456.25 $456.25
18 | Ladies V-neck t-shirt, 100% cotton 1 job 800.00 $800.00 900.00 $900.00 779.80 $779.80
19 | Shipping charge for one gross of t-shirts 1 ea NO CHARGE 10.00 $10.00 30.00 $30.00
20 | folding/bagging items 1 ea 1.00 $1.00 0.25 $0.25 0.50 $0.50
21 | screen charge, per screen 1 ea - $0.00 15.00 $15.00 15.00 $15.00
22 | screen printing set-up charge 1 ea - $0.00 5.00 $5.00 - $0.00
23 | prepare artwork 1 hr 45.00 $45.00 40.00 $40.00 - $0.00
24 | personalization - screen printing 1 ea NO BID 5.00 $5.00 18.00 $18.00
25 | personalization - heat press 1 ea NO BID 10.00 $10.00 - $0.00
26 | personalization - embroidery 1 ea 9.00 $9.00 4.00 $4.00 5.00 $5.00
E-1 | delivery time - screen print 5-10 DAYS 10 BUS. DAYS 5-7 DAYS
E-2 | delivery time - embroidery 2 - 3WEEKS 10 BUS. DAYS 5-7 DAYS
SUBTOTAL - SCREEN PRINT $29,660.00 $23,920.68 $28,850.66
SUBTOTAL - EMBROIDERY $3,815.00 $4,081.74 3,397.41
SUBTOTAL - OTHER ITEMS $55.00 $89.25 $68.50
GRAND TOTAL $33,530.00 $28,091.67 $32,316.57
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