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BID NUMBER: 504-16
DATE OPENED: February 9, 2016

BID TABULATION
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR:

SMALL LAWN EQUIPMENT REPAIR AND PARTS

ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. UNIT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT

NO. QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 Honda Tillers 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.000 15%

2 Honda Generators 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.000 15%

3 Red Max Weedeaters 1 Pct 10.000 10% 20.000 20% No Bid 15.000 15%

4 Red Max Blowers 1 Pct 10.000 10% 20.000 20% No Bid 15.000 15%

5 Red Max Gas Hedge Trimmers 1 Pct 10.000 10% 20.000 20% No Bid 15.000 15%

6 Toro Commercial Lawnmowers 1 Pct No Bid 20.000 20% 20.000 20% 20.000 20%

7 Grasshopper Mower 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Honda Trash Pumps 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.000 15%

9 Honda Self-priming Water Pump 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.000 15%

10 Stihl Weedeaters 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.000 20%

11 Stihl Concrete Saw 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.000 20%

12 Stihl Backpack Blowers 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.000 20%

13 Stihl Hand Held Blower 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.000 20%

14 Stihl Stick Edgers 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.000 20%

15 Stihl Auger 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.000 20%

16 Stihl Gas Hedge Trimmers 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.000 20%

17 Stihl Chainsaws 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.000 20%

18 Stihl Power Pole Pruners 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.000 20%

19 Billy Goat Vacuum 1 Pct No Bid 15.000 15% No Bid 10.000 10%

20 McLane Edgers 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.000 5%

21 Briggs and Stratton Engines 1 Pct No Bid 15.000 15% No Bid 5.000 5%

22 Ditch Witch Trenchers 1 Pct No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 Toro ZTR 1 Pct No Bid 20.000 20% 30.000 30% 20.000 20%

24 Echo Power Pruners 1 Pct No Bid 20.000 20% No Bid 15.000 15%

25 Echo Hand Tillers 1 Pct No Bid 20.000 20% No Bid 15.000 15%

26 Maximum Repair Time: Normal Repairs 1 Day 3 - 5 3 - 5 days 2 - 4 2 - 4 days 8 8 days 2 - 3 2 - 3 days

27 Maximum Repair Time: Emergency Repairs 1 Day 1 1 days 1 - 3 1 - 3 days 4 4 days 1 - 2 1 - 2 days

28 Cost Per Hour for Labor 1 Hr 65.00 $65/hour 75.00 $75/hour 108.00 $108/hour 79.95 $79.95/hour

TOTAL GROSS PRICE N/A N/A N/A N/A

CASH DISCOUNT

TOTAL NET PRICE

DELIVERY As needed As needed As needed As needed

F.O.B Destination Destination Destination Destination

LCS Professional Richardson

Longhorn Inc.Lawn Care Supply, Inc. Saw & LawnmowerTurf Products, LP.
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